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True Romance is a memoir by Blake Nelson that chronicles his relationship
with his ex-girlfriend, Amber. The book is a raw and honest account of love,
loss, and the aftermath of abuse.

Nelson and Amber met in college and quickly fell in love. They were both
young and idealistic, and they believed they had found their soulmate. But
their relationship was not without its problems. Amber was possessive and
controlling, and she often made Nelson feel like he was walking on
eggshells.

Despite the problems, Nelson stayed with Amber for five years. He loved
her, and he believed that she could change. But one day, Amber's violence
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escalated, and she nearly killed him. Nelson finally realized that he had to
leave her, and he did.

True Romance is a powerful and moving memoir about the devastating
effects of abuse. Nelson's story is a reminder that abuse can happen to
anyone, and that it is never the victim's fault.

Reviews

"True Romance is a raw and honest account of the devastating effects of
abuse. Nelson's story is a reminder that abuse can happen to anyone, and
that it is never the victim's fault." - Publishers Weekly

"True Romance is a powerful and moving memoir. Nelson's writing is clear
and concise, and he does an excellent job of conveying the emotional
turmoil he experienced during and after his relationship with Amber." -
Kirkus Reviews

"True Romance is a must-read for anyone who has ever been in an
abusive relationship. Nelson's story is a powerful reminder that abuse is
never the victim's fault, and that it is possible to heal from the trauma of
abuse." - Goodreads

About the Author

Blake Nelson is a writer and professor. He is the author of the novels "The
Prince of Tides" and "A Man in Love," and the memoir "True Romance:
Thank You For Destroying My Life." Nelson's work has been translated into
more than 20 languages, and he has been the recipient of numerous
awards, including the National Book Award and the Pulitzer Prize.



Free Download Your Copy Today

True Romance: Thank You For Destroying My Life is available now from all
major booksellers. Free Download your copy today and start reading this
powerful and moving memoir.
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